ENTEAED

Allen, Pam, NMENV

From: Kliphuis, Trais, NMENV

Sent: Wednesday, May 02, 2012 1:54 PM
To: Allen, Pam, NMENV

Subject: FW: Fee Letter Language

For the record. Thanks.

From: Chavez, Rick - RES [mailto:Rick.Chavez@wipp.ws]
Sent: Wednesday, May 02, 2012 12:23 PM

To: Kliphuis, Trais, NMENV

Subject: Re: Fee Letter Language

Thanks
Rick Chavez

From: Kliphuis, Trais, NMENV [mailto:trais.kliphuis@state.nm.us]

Sent: Wednesday, May 02, 2012 09:54 AM

To: Chavez, Rick - RES

Cc: Kehrman, Bob - RES; Kieling, John, NMENV <john.kieling@state.nm.us>
Subject: Fee Letter Language

Hi Rick,

| believe | understand your question regarding the working in the Fee Letter. It seems to imply that there was an active
transmittal performed by the Permittees for the April 12 and April 19 fees. | reviewed a few older fee letters and the
language is consistent with what has previously been used yet | do not believe the intent of the language was to indicate
there was an activity on behalf of the Permittee for those fees. You comment is noted and the Department will update
this language so that it reads more accurately in the future.

Thank you for bringing this to my attention. Please feel free to call me if you have further questions or concerns.

Trais Kliphuis

WIPP Staff Manager

Hazardous Waste Bureau

New Mexico Environment Department
2905 Rodeo Park Drive E, Building 1
Santa Fe, New Mexico 87505

Office: 505-476-6051
Fax: 505-476-6060
Front Desk: 505-476-6000

From: Chavez, Rick - RES [mailto:Rick.Chavez@wipp.ws]
Sent: Monday, April 23, 2012 9:37 AM
To: Kliphuis, Trais, NMENV 12050
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Cc: Kehrman, Bob - RES o b
Subject: FW:

Trais:

I have a trivial question on the attached letter. It says that we transferred payment of the fees on April 12 and April 19
of 2012. We sent the check up for supplemental fees up in October 2011. What is the reference to April 12 and April 19
for?

Thanks,

Rick Chavez, Manager

WTS LLC Regulatory Compliance Department
Contractor to the Department of Energy
4021 National Parks Highway MS GSA-109
Carlsbad, NM 88220

575-234-7405



